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Seminar & Workshop ofEWU 
Agro-Industrialization Club 

S MANY AS 19 
students c lub is 
funCtiOn ine: in East 

West University (EWU) giv­
ing the students a taste of 
practical knowledge and ex­
pelience beyond 'academiC 
books . -The Agro­
[ndustlializalioll Club is the 
first. agro-IJased cl ub ill llle 
private unive rsi lies wh ich 
started it journey 011 i\[Xi l 
o l. 20 I I WiLll th e slogan 
"Enlighten ing thewo rldwith 
the co lor of AQ)iculture ". 

Receilllv f~ur EWU s tu ­
dents will] an abid ing il1ler-

est in a.e:riculture joined a 
program' titled 'Firey Chol 
Matir Ta ney' of Channel-I. 
The vision of this club is to 
faCilitate a platform to s tu ­
dents so that they can gel 
acquainted With Llle diverse 
aspects of aglicultul'e and 
contribu te in this sector. [n 
lh is respecl. the c lub organ­
Izes seminars and work ­
shops for bu ilding ski lls of 
the students aI\d for creat ­
ing awareness. 

So far the club orga ni zed 
a semina r titled "Tilapia, a 
Go[den Kev of Career" and 
;1 workshojl 011 "!':nhc1.nc-f1.Q 

a gricultural development 
through social media" at the 
EWU campus. Besides. for 
a field level expelience. an 
outd oor worksllOp on 
"Technology and a.gricul­
ture: Bridge to a new possi ­
bility" wa s organized in 
Manikgonj. Recently. an ex­
hilJition and semilla r 0 11 

"Agro expos ition and idea 
sha li ng" was held 011 E\VU 
campus. The purpose of this 
even t was to en rich stu­
dems' knowledge alxlut par­
UcipaLi I\g inan organization 
, \I ld as wei! as i1l0LiV<l1lllg 

LlH"Il l to !Juilci a gro--lJase'd ill -

dustries along with develop­
ing themselves as success­
ful entrepreneurs In the fu­
ture . 

Through these activilies 
sludeIlls will be able t.o con­
tli lJute in the agricultural 
sector as well a s the econo­
my of Ban gladesh. 
Fu 11hennore as a 'studen t 
and member of the club. we 
have le,lrned that as a citi ­
zen of Bangladesh it is ou r 
responsibility to use our in ­
novative a nd c realive skills 
[or the wel fare of ourlJeloved 
nalion . 
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